AN Submit Proposals By Upload

Supplier Portal Training Quick Reference Guide

Task: Respond to Bids and Solicitations via Upload and Submit Online from Supplier Public
Homepage Portal
Bidder: ® Click the Sign In Tile from the Supplier Public Homepage Portal

* Supplier Public Homepage

Award Details

Bidding Opportunities

Sign In User Registration

B

Notice Of Intent to Award

ﬁ

0 Notices in 90 Days

B

25 Opportunities

View Registration Options

FAQs | Contact Us

Get helpful information here.

Step \ Instructions

1 W Takes you to the Sign-In page
e Enter Email Address and Password and click S@ni.

Sign In X
Email Address |[Email Address

Password | Password

[J Enable Screen Reader Mode

akes you to the Supplier Secure Homepage
2 W Tak to the Supplier S H
Click the Bidding Opportunities Tile

w Supplier Secure Homepage |

Bidding Opportunities FAQs | Contact Us Manage Profile Secure Notice Of Intent Award

it g

26 Events Get helpful information here Update your Registration and Profile 06 Notices in 90 Days

Awarded Events Bidding Homepage

S A

02 Award(s) in 90 days
01 Non Award in 90 days
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WV Submit Proposals By Upload
Strategic Sourcing Training Quick Reference Guide

Step \ Instructions

W Takes you to the Bidding Opportunities Page
3

e By default, Invited Events will list the Bidding Opportunities that matches the US NAICS Code and/or US
SIC Code that you registered to

e Click the Expand icon
e |[f there are no specific events listed, click l@]

€ Supplier Secure Homepage Bidding Opportunities

“View By B Status v A

T raws. Time Zone  Pacific Time (US) [V Date Format | MMDDYY v Apply

Bidding Event Information

: M-

1 row
Now 28
Buying Organization | Event
Evant Name Ernt D Farmat [ Type Start Date | End Date Ends In Bid Status Dekalle

Accapted [ m

There are no svents to display, please check filter options.

4 e Click anywhere over next to the Event Name you are interested in:
Suppier Securs Homepage Bidding Opportunities
Tiens Zone  Pachic Time (LS} ~ Datw Format | MMODOYY (v Apply.

Bidding Event information

It Events Public Events

6 v

- .
Event Hame Buying Organization | EventiD  Format Typs Start Diste | End Date Endsin Bid Status et

M Test with ine attachment m”:'ﬁ 2:1 m:m$ :: m m: 10 days Hew » &
PP At o 01 o T = ez s ror 2en e .

RFP s and Line Altachments 524 . ol posotsuntbsmndl 2 days Mew »
R o T s ezt iror e e ,
T o=y - e e ST
R For Inke AL Transit RFI 0ARE000 1052 AM POT

et For Inkommation 0191485 Fx CE0G0 1052 AM POT 23 days Hew '
RFP 2019-1039% Bus Operator Training Boolcamp A Transt 2:1 xﬁgﬁg;; m x: 26 days New ¥

5 e Click View Bid Package link to view the Bid and Solicitation Announcements and Attachment
¢ Biacng Opporminites Event Details T
it BidonEvent | 7 UploadBid | € Acceptinvitation
~ Bidding Event information
Event Mamne REFP 2018.10006 Bus Operator Traning Bootearmp Event Start Date OAZ0020 02 23 P PDT
B Uit AC Transt Event End Dt (0020 02 23 PM PDT

vent 1D DOOOO000GS und 1
Event Status  Posted Event Version 1
Buyer Mame Maria Cecila Young Event Format Sell
Sealed Evert Yes Event Type RFx
Paymant Terms Mhiltips Bids Mot Mowed
Contact information bara Ceclla Young | 1) Edits 10 Submisted Bids Yes

w Lines

Trow
Lire Number Bid Mandstory It Description Requested QuantitUOM Comments and Attschments
1 Mo BOLT: PUMP SUPPORT, HEX HEAD, TRANSMISS! [8-16 X 2147 LONG) I‘.O:J
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Strategic Sourcing Training Quick Reference Guide

Step \ Instructions

6 e Open, View and Save each of the Attachments below to your local drive/documents folder
e The document attachments contain the comprehensive proposals from AC Transit
e Click * to exit from the View Bid Package page

View Bid Package x
= Attachments
Filename Description
o RFP_2019 5_Operator_Bootcamp_irev._02.28.2019)_(1).paf RFF 2018-10358
= RFP_2015-10386 Operator_Training_Bootcamp.xmi Event Bid Package
wm RFP_2019-10396_Bus_Operator_Training_Bootcamp. pdf Event Details
- Commants
The Mlameda-Contra Gosta Transa Distct (the "Disticr”) is requesting propasals from qualified firms to provide an appk tht will and analyze the Distnct's senice rekabdity system-wide with the go.
More
Please submit an electronic vession of your proposal conforming 1o the requirements stated in Section C.2 on Pages 4-5 of the RFP by 4:00 pm. Pacific Time on Thursday, July 2, 2020 o org. In the alternative, hardee.

More

7 B Open MS Excel
e Navigate to your documents file folder then click the XML file to open
e Click the Enable Editing box

Name

@ AP__RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Train.pdf
| (xEj AP__RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Train.xml
&= File_Attachment_1.docx

@ PROTECTED VIEW Be careful—files from the Internet can contain viruses. Unless you need to edit, it's safer to stay in Protected View. | | Enable Editing | |

Al 2 Je

| Event Details
PeopleSoft Strategic Sourcing

EventID Format Type Round Version Bidder: Cloverbrook Office Supplies
ENT01-0000000124 Sell RFx 1 1 1600 Franklin
Event Name Qakland, CA 94612
AP: RFP Create an Event Test/Train United States
Start Time Finish Time Submit To:  AC Transit
04/22/2020 11:14 AM PST 04/22/2020 04:14 PM PST 10626 E 14th Street
Event Currency: US Dollar QOakland, CA 94603
Bids Allowed in Other Currency: No United States
Contact: Michael Daly
Phone: 510/891-5469

Email: vperez@actransit.org

8 e On the General Details tab, answer all General Questions with Bid Factor Response Required: Yes
o Enter each Response for each question in the Response and Response Comments box
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Strategic Sourcing Training Quick Reference Guide

Step \ Instructions

PeopleSoft Strategic Sourcing

Event Details

Event ID Format Type Round Version Bidder: Cloverbrook Office Supplies
ENTO01-0000000124 Sell RFx 1 1 1600 Franklin
Event Name Oakland, CA 94612
AP: RFP Create an Event Test/Train United States
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: AC Transit
04/22/2020 11:14 AM PST 04/22/2020 04:14 PM PST 10626 E 14th Street
Event Currency: US Doallar Oakland, CA 94603 s
Bids Allowed in Other Currency: No United States
Contact: Michael Daly
Phone: 510/891-5469
Email: vperez@actransit.org
Event Description
General Questions
Question uom Best Worst Response:

ldeal Response Required: No

Experience, Qualifications and Expertise

Bid Factor Response Required: Yes

s

Ready

General Details | Line Details | Terms & Conditions |

®

2 .

e Select Yes/No Item! -

General Details | Line Details Terms & Conditions ‘

Go to the Line Details tab

Yeu/the e

L

= | next to the No Bid box

o Enter the Price Per Item in the Response box (Repeat these steps for Events with multiple line items)

Line Details
No Bid | |
Line: 1 Item ID: Line Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Quantity:
Bid Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Event to Create an RFP
The requested quantity is required. You cannot change the quantity for this line.
|Price Details Best Worst Response:

Price Per ltem

|Quantity Details

Requested

Minimum Quantity:

Maximum Quantity:

0
1
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Step \ Instructio

10

e Read the terms and conditions in the Terms and Conditions tab| General Detals | Line Details [ Terms & Conditons |

Event Details
PeopleSoft Strategic Sourcing

Event ID Format Type Round Version Biddear:

ENTO1-0000000124 Sell RFx 1 1 |

Event Name

AP RFP Create an Event TesUTran

Start Time Finish Time Submit Te:

042212020 11:14 AM PST 0472272020 0414 PM PST

Event Currency: US Dofar

Bids Allowed in Other Currency: Ma
Contact:
Phone:
Emaii:

Terms & Conditions

Cloverbrook Office Supplies
1600 Frankiin

Dakland, CA 94612

United States

AC Transit

10626 E 14th Streat
Oakland. CA 94603

United States

Michael Daly

5108915469

vperezi@actransit.org

1. Terms & Condtions
Statement of Copyright and Cwnership, Trademarks and Disclaimes

Copynght

All content on the AC Transit Web site htip-/'www.actransit org including text, graphics, logos, button icons, databases and images, Is the property of AC Transit o its content suppliers and is profected by copynght
laws The collection, arrangement and assembly of all content on this site is the exclusive property of AC Transit and is protected by copyright laws. Content on this site may be uSed as a resource only. Any ofher
use, including the reproduction, modification, distribution, ransmission, repubkcation, display or performance is strictly prohibited

11

e Save the document from File, Save As, enter a file name and click Save

e Click Yes to the Microsoft Excel pop-up message

SHve AP_RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Train_REPLY

Normal XML Spreadsheet 2003 (*.xml)

More options..,

Save As

File T‘ [~ Documents > APEREZ > PS StratSrcing > PS 55 Testing Results = XML = 124b

- [ save

Microsoft Excel

Do you want to keep using that format?

No Help

Some features in your workbook might be lost if you save it as XML Spreadsheet 2003.

X

12

I% Upload Bid

e Click

€ IRdding Opportunitios

= Bidding Event Information
RFIP 2015-10396 Bus Opeswior Training Boolcamg

M AL Tramsh
0000000095

Pasted

w Lines

Ham Deacription

BOLT: PUMP SUPPORT, HEX HEAD, TRANSMISS] (18716 X 244" LONG)

Event Details

ot Bid on Evest Uptoad Bid & Accept Invhation (% Decling Invitatlon
Event Start Dare  OB202020 02-23 PM PDT
L 02000 02:23 P POT
1
1
Evast Type RFM
Multiphs Bids ot Aowed
Edlita 1 Subrmittod Hids Yas
Trow
Requasted ChassiityLHOM Comanents amd Attachmonts
100.0000
Each
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Step \ Instructions
13 Click e ]

Upload Bid
EventID ENT01-0000000124 Format Buy Type RFx
Round 1 Version 2
Event Name AP: RFP Event Response XML/Hard copy
Start Date  04/28/2020 6:30AM PDT End Date 04/29/2020 3
Select XML File Return to Bidding Homepage

To upleoad a bid:

1. Open the Excel version of this event that you have been working with

2. Do a File-=Save As. Before hitting save, make sure to change the "Save as Type" to "XML Spreadsheet."
3. Using the Select XML File Button , select the XML Spreadsheet that was just saved.

4. Verify the path showing is correct and push the Upload button:

:00PM PDT

< Sourcing Bidder Homepage Upload Bid

Welcome, Cloverbrook Office
Supplies
User: Clover

14 ¥ File Attachment page appears

Click Browse to select the XML file with the response from your documents folder and click Upload

File Attachment .
@ AP_RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Train.pdf

@ AP_RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Trainxml

C:\Usersvperoz Documents APERE._Bro

| @ AP_RFP_Create_an_Event_Test_Train_REPLY.xml

o= File_Attachment_1.docx

Upload | Cancel

15 W Takes you to the Event Details page appears

Event Details

Submit Bid Save for Later

Evont Name  AP: RFP Event Response XMLMHard copy Gidding Insinictior

EventlD ENTO1-0000000124

Sell Event

BidiD 1

Event Format/Type RFx

Bid Date
1
2

04/28/2020 6:30AM PDT
D4/28/2020 0300 FM POT

Event Round

Bid Currency  USD 5 pgllar
Event Version

Event Start Date

Event End Date

Hide Additional Event Info

Description:

Click Validate Entries button and ensure there are No Errors Found in the uploaded file, then click OK

< Bid Upload Event Details ﬁ. ‘\' E

New Window |

Help | Personalize Page |
‘Welcome, Cloverbrook Office Suppllies

User: Clover

No errors found. (18058,313)
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Step \ Instructions

16 From Step 1: Answer General Event Questions

¢ Review each of the General Event Questions and the Responses

Step 1: Answer General Event Questions

The event adminisirator requests your response to questions nat specific fo any specific ilem.

General Event Questions L}
Required Questions [
Questions Responsed To ]

Hide Event Questions

Event Questions

+ Bid Required *Ideal Response Required

Previor -

Next
General Questions Questi 1076/¥]  Questions

*

Experience, Qualifications and Expertise

4= Add Comments or Altachments
Response || Highly experlence L

17 - Additional Response for Every Question

e Click Add Comments or Attachments |ink to each to confirm responses are uploaded
o Enter additional response for every Question in the Add New Comments field

o To upload a file as additional response for every Question, click . Uplead

» File Attachment page appears, click Browse to search and select the file and click = UpPlead
= To add more attachments, click the Add New Attachments link

e Click " to take you back to the Event Details page

Question Comments and Attachments x
Help
Business Unit  ENTO1 Event D 0000000124
P . Quali and Experti
Attachments
Add New Attachments
== 11|
Attached File Attachment Description Upload View
| Upload | View Add New Atachments  Delete
Comments
Add New Comments
Over 30 years of experience in the industry &
Add New Attachmants File Attachment x
G 11001 Help
Attached File Attachment Description Upload View Browse..

View Add New Attachments — Dalate Upload Cancel
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Step \ Instructions

18 From Step 2: Answer General Event Questions

e Click to uncheck the No Bid checkbox

Step 2: Enter Line Bid Responses

This event contains one or more individual lines that awail your bid response. Some of all lines may require your bid in order for consideration by the Event
Administrator.
Lines in This Event 1

Lines Responded To 1
Your Total Line Pricing 0.0000 USD

Hide Line Detal
*Bid Required {Line Comments/Files
Lines
5 Q 1-10f 1]v| View All
Line Deseription unit Eogisaiet JEONEIC e NoBid  Your Total Bid Price

Quantity ‘Quantity Price

1 Event to Create an RFP HR 1.0000 -

0.0000 USD Bid

1 9 ;n_ur Unit Bid
e Your Unit Bid Price field becomes available, a unit bid price :l for the Line Item
Bid
o Click the Bid link of the Line Item
Lines
5 Q 1-10ot1v] View Al
Line Description Unit E:‘:::;;“ g:‘;;::;’ :::;U"" Bid No Bid Your Total Bid Price
1 Eventlo Greate an RFP HR 1.0000 : 0.0000 USD Bid @
Lines
B Q 1-1at1)v] View Al
Line Description Unit E:‘:::;;‘y“" ;m’n::;' ;3‘;;”““ Birl No Bid Your Total Bid Price
1 Event to Create an RFP HR 1.0000 ] 0.0000 USD

20 | W The Bid Link takes you to the Line Item page

e You can also enter Bid Price in the Your Unit Bid Price field (if it is not yet entered)

View/Add Question Comments and Attachments ‘

e Click to enter Comments or file attachments in the

. Validate Entrie
e Click = ki to make sure there are no errors found
e Click Saefortater {5 save entries
Start Page

o Click to take you back to the Event Details page
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Strategic Sourcing Training Quick Reference Guide

Step \ Instructions
e —————————————iic

< Bid Upload Line Details
Line Details
Save for Later Start Page Validate Entries
Line 1of 1
Line Details &
tme 1 ) ) O NoBid
Event to Create an RFP L Response Required  No
Category Miscellaneous Services
I View/Add Question Comments and Attachments I
Exact request quantity required
Unit of Measure  Hour Your Unit Bid Price
M REqUEsn o Total Bid Price  0.0000 USD
Your Max Bid Quantity Heswienes fio
Max Quantity 1.0000
* Shipping Information
5 Q 1+10f1[¥]
Ship Quantity  Due Date Ship To Location Ship Via Freight Terms
1.0000 0412712020 CRWA View
» Item Specification
21 e Click * for Line Comments and Attachments
e Enter Comments in the Add New Comments field
e Click |- |to upload a file. File Attachment page appears. Click Browse to search file in your

documents folder then click |- == | Enter an Attachment Description.
e To add new attachment, click the Add New Attachments link

e Click " ® 1 to take you back to the Event Details page

Lines

m Q 110l 1w View All
Line Deseription Unit apnt Mool Yok Bl NoBid  Your Total Bid Price

1 Event to Creale an RFP HR 1.0000 m] 00000 USD Bid E
Line Comments and Attachments x
He
Event D 0000000124 Line 1

Ewvont 1o Croate an RFP
Attachments
Add New Attachments

i) 1101
Attached File Attachment Description Upload View

Upload View Add New Altachmonts Duata

Comments

Add New Comments

-
File Attachment x
Help
Browse.
OK Cancel Upload Cancel
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Step \ Instructions

22 W Takes you back at the Event Details page

Save for Later

e Click © to Save all entries

< Bid Upload Event Details

s Welcome, Cleverbrock Office Supplies
Event Details User Clover

Submit Bid Save for Later Validate Entries

Event Name AP RFP Evenl Response XML/Hard copy Bickting Instructions.

EventiD ENTO-0000000124 BidID 1
Event FormatiType  Sell Event HFx Bid Date
Event Round 1 )
Bid Currency |USD 5 Dollar
Event Version 2
Event Start Date  04/28/2020 6:30AM POT

Event End Date  D4/292020 03 00 £ BOT

Hick: Ackdibionial Event Info

23 e Scroll down towards the bottom of the page
e Click the Events Comments and Attachments link

[ Event Comments and Aftachments ]

At any point in the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time, When your bid response is complete, submit for consideration.

Submit Bid Save for Later Validate Entries

Retumn to Bidding Homepage

24 o The Event Package (PDF, XML), Attachments, Addendums, Comments/Announcements from AC Transit
are listed under the View Event Attachments
e To upload your entire File Proposal and Response to AC Transit, click the Upload button
o0 Browse the file and Upload

o Enter an Attachment Description

e Click the Add New Attachments link for additional files to Upload

o Enter any Comments in the Add New Comments box

e Click the OK button
View Event Attachments &

5 1-50f 6|

Attached File Attachment Description View
2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200318.pdl 2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200319 View
2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200318.xm| Event Bid Package View
2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200319.xml Event Bid Package View
2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200319.pdf Event Detalls View
2020-10435_Public_Info_Educ_RFP_200319.pdl Event Details View
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Step \ Instructions

Event Com and Attachment: x
Add New Attachments (& "
] 1-1 of 1[v]
Arttached File Attachment Description Upload View
File_Attachment__-_Proposal_to_AC_Transil docx Proposal Response to AC Transid Upload View Hudd New Allachments | Delele
Comments
View Event Comments (7 lot2iv| b M
Description Al E
The Alameda-Contra Costa Transit Destrict (the "District”) is requesting proposats from qualified firms 10 prowvsde public outreach consulting
sernces m suppor of the Distncl's plan o possibly place a revenue measure for voler approval m the 2020 general electon. The
sucoessful proposer will perform a Feasibility Assessment for such a measure, evaluating demographic trends among volers in the Destrict
and projected voler lumoul, workang wilh a pollster lo understand current voler percepbions and needs. I the such a revenue measure
proves feasible, the selected firm will Develop and refine a revenus measure for the ballot, detarmining the most favorable type of
Develop and a public ion and program, selecting and supenising graphic designers, media W
ouiblets and othesr vendoes assncabed wath such an outresach effod. Prenane a sesenty-frae (751 Wioned Ballot Cuoeshon and Pronades Onaoonn

File Attachment X
Help

| Browse...

Upload Cancel

Add New Comments @

oK Cancel

25 W Takes you back to the Event Details page

o Click o SRR {6 Save all entries
° CI|Ck Validate Entries
e Click OK if No errors are found in your entries

o CIick‘

Submit Bid

Event Commenis and Attachments

At any pointin the bid response process you may Save an in-prograss bid and rasume completion at later ime. Whan your bid response 15 complete, submit for consideration
Submit Bid Save for Later Validate Entries

Return ta Creale Bidder Responss

No errors found. (18058,313)
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Step \ Instructions

< Bid Upload Event Details

; Widcome, Cloverbrook Office Supplies
Event Details User Clover

Submit Bid Save for Later Validate Entries

EventName AP RFP Event Response XML Had copy Bkding bnstruciions

EventID ENT01-0000000124 Bidin 1
Event Format/Type  Sell Event RFx Bid Date
E R d 1
TR Bid Currency  USD s pogar

Event Version 2
Event Start Date  (M/282020 830AM PDT

o ap
EventEnd Date 4T BI00PMPDY

Hide Additonal Evenl Info

26

¥ Bid Confirmation page appears
e Click OK

< Bid Upload

Bid Confirmation

Your bid has been successfully submitted.

BidID 1 Bid Date 04/28/2020 11:03:13AM PDT
Event ID 0000000124 AP: RFP Event Response XML/Hard copy
Event Format Sell Event Round 1 Version 2

Start Date  04/28/2020 6:30AM PDT End Date 04/29/2020 03:00 PM PDT

Your Total Price  16,000.00 USD
OK

W Takes you back to the Bidding Home Page

SCOTTS BARBER SHOP Bidding Home Page

< Bid Confirmation

Welcome, SCOTT'S BARBER SHOP
User SCOTTS

SCOTT'S BARBER SHOP Bidding Home Page

) Click here o access detals and review your bids on Event: ENTO1 - 0000000127 AP: RFP-Event Online Responze

her inquines or othe:

Click here
Click here for admanistratve items such as updates to your profile or categonzations

e A softcopy of the entered Bid Response is sent to your registered Email address

20 11:04 AM

transit.org
Your bid has been received

o

@ If there are problems with how this message is displayed, click here to view it in a web browser.

Your_Bid.pdf _

End of Procedure.
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